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Learning Korean Culture: Embodied Visuality 
 
This paper describes an interactive visual and audio experience in-
tended for a mixed Korean-Western crowd at an electronic music 
club in Busan, Korea, aimed at teaching interconnected lessons. First, 
dance is a visual-audio-motile-emotive art, highlighting intermodal 
aspects of perception. Second and relatedly, through repeated rhythms 
from electronic genres such as techno and house music playing 
alongside an interactive visual breathing exercise, we will emphasize 
the body as a synergic system that achieves greater unity by co-
ordinating around environmental contours. Third and most impor-
tantly, insofar as each individual synchronizes to the visualized col-
lective breath and music, and inasmuch as each person’s activity af-
fects the visual and audio display, we hope to cultivate social coordi-
nation, in turn instilling a sense of communal consciousness, and 
therewith Dewey’s idea that experience is shared and cultural, a no-
tion also conveyed in the Korean concept of uri or “we-self”. Dewey 
in fact spent several years in China, and perhaps absorbed the idea of 
co-dependent origination, central to Buddhism but also carried in 
outlooks such as Daoism. The principle is that things and their prop-
erties and even agents are metaphysically interdependent and such 
that they only show up together – an important lesson in an increas-
ingly divided world. While uri is a primary experience for Koreans, it 
is typically foreign to Westerners, which creates a challenge, accord-
ing to Merleau-Ponty’s phenomenology. This is that 1) primary expe-
rience arises through bodily messing about in the world; 2) this pri-
mary experience is of a sort that cannot readily be communicated by 



conventional abstract means such as language; and 3) primary experi-
ence is nonetheless the material out of which abstraction arises, in-
cluding the concept of uri. Broadly, then, we hope that our interac-
tive visual and audio exercise opens an experiential sense of oneness, 
especially to Westerners. 
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